Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2024

CHOE NMQ

KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWImeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW1SI018H00®] (nIM1RVe]S)EmMOY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

®1) UMD L) @0, 2024 20 2] 04
04th March 2024
Qudealfo 13 o1& 0d . . mmid
vol. Xl 1199 doBo 20 No 820
' Thiruvananthapuram, 20th Kumbham 1199
Monday 1945 o02M®N)Mo 14
14th Phalguna 1945

GHh 03 MVAINID

dloa (Heamldmmosemoe-mil) Qlda]

Qll2610)2a1Mo

MmmId 64/ee1u).ail1/2023/ml@oo. @YUMo, 2024 MOBa] 2
1199 djoo 18

1945 ano@doymo 12.

BHO8 MVoMNIM MIWATVEDNS IO BYBY  HaldMERMEBBINS
@olailer1ee o] DBINI@ (@ IMSlERLEE|SICMIIM]. MIWATVE aIldRIESD (@ 15H00MSB

enflgjlay 2024 @0@.4] 1-00 G| VAIBEROIOS ERMIADI LIGl)).

1AIBEINNOS 20O (@ IE:000,

aVl. allsselsdnl,
Nalalf@3 V501 (MD120).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




2024-a€1 6-00 GG
2024-9e1 65,08 MMIaVleeilgl (6@ GYB:Q
1994-0e1 608 MMlmile joeildl @re:q aflensio 6RO HaIgM@IMSS
630}
@OBY
ofldle,.—1994-0e1 6508 olMVleoeillgl @BE]  O@IMBUDaHo  BOEMIaM

@YQIUDIEERUBESID aflensle BRRLMI ©.21QRM T WYEMAIDIBIHBNB@ILN0;

300® OlajeRfleslong ag)9ilODIEmIT0 MVEQIGTLEGTHI IO |ODo (@100
MMM H6)MYi—

1. 21)0}86)Ga |00 (@1000GANe.—(1) D @GN 2024-6e1 608 MmMIadlejoeilg
(6RO EYBY  ag)M Gald alO@o.

(2) v @sGleel 25-00 aldafleel (i), (vi) MRS 9503 (@I06eNILIODI@D
QIO)M Mo BUOHIBNM QB jdud 2023 Aullamuoenid 9-00 GBI (@1o6enIeIOYTIGd
QM @O0 BSOS

2. 58-00 QId)q {lN)88 6BEVTI.—1994-6e1 8608 MMMl jorilgl @ e:gleel, (1994-
eel 20)(@IY GudaHo (IWIM @YY af)MIEM al0INBUlE66)0]S)E:) 58-00 QB {len]
(1)-00 9alQIB)a @ “CHMNaIBlaldSlS:UB,” o) ADSSIMo  alleaMOTIMe  GUDaHO
“@0ellnyMoMIe:06Mo,” ag)aM AIIE}0 allaMlle GalBELHENZ®I6EN).

3. XVle@) o) @RELP®O  GalBBO@.—(EIWIM BVBFIOl 325-00 Qldsaflay
GUDaHOIe  “@0ellNo DIV  OalQY@” o)  UTlBHBODIMINIS:SeRMOD

“@ELPO XVI ag)” o) G2IQCHEENB®IG).

4. 325a4) o) a 3@ Qo] B2IBLODB.—(@IWIM @YBQI@, “BOELP@o  XVI
og) @2ellnEERUd B0 §2IQY@”, af)MM UBlBUSHEODIN) GUDaHo IO alODIAM
Qldrla] GalGBHOEMZMIEN), BGOOIWO).—

“3250g). l@QJalMo.—E0D  BPELPVOVIOMDIe  58-00  Qldlo{lom@io
@RYOUUDODICRISHID] “@efllmimomie0emo” ag)OMO@d auomoeilmyo
9B |eSW88 MoLlMiEnRses BAMICIEOT, GUDRIOEMoO, WMINMo, TVoERO6Mo,
MoMU&06Mo BREEIEIT BHOQIFIVW@B ag)(m) @PAELAMIB:M@I6N) .

ollvoEle,06mo.—s0m @ORLOVOTITD 9aleIUIlaflgi88™)0 ale &Y

mldqjailafislgoom@mie  egymo@d  1986-0e1  aldlaudl@]l  (Vood:Hem)  @OB:QleI0
(1986-0£1 29-00 GBHMB ©BYHY) GOOIM  HlFIEd  9eNLSVIY88  a1geBRS]RI0

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




MIBQY2ilolSI88MMO®  AUDBEGUWEN0  (EIGWIMEBBRUBBN0  (EITIOR®  BOB:Flello
alge@nglelo @D  @INO@GADe MMHVIF88 @RE®  GRAOBRUB
26emoladlesymmos).”.

5. 326-00 QB lM88 BREWM.—([EIWIM GBYB:GleL! 326-00 QI {ldd,—

() (1ag) 201013 {lMY ald00 IO ODIM DalQldle] GalBGHSENI®I6EN),
@RI —

“(lag)) D @RELPVODVIER DD AP Bl¥lenss igeErsleNo,
1986-0e1 a1dlmubl®l (Mooe:uem) @BgImio (1986-681 29-00 GH(B GYGQ) GO
S @D 96M3086IIg 88 algeansleno QI§QINO 021QOS88OROOD
@oellm§mMomiG:0ema@a@l  niMwea]s  mmMIadlgoeillglanes g0 &Sadsio
20MOANGIMIER8e  alla®eld:slo &Hemavleldd  mlela imaoldlesym oo,
SDeMMI@ @PGIOG BSAB:8}0 DOMOAUIGIMEBBBl0 2BAMEIGSB)o HAVEE SO MGEUM
mldqjaolessenzmmos.”;

(ii) @IS0 ald:®0 GalBB96]3 (1ag)) Dalld:)afl0) BUdaHo @I |O@IIM
DalQldh)a] BalBGHHENZMOIEI, GOGIWOY:—

“(lagreg) (lag) Qalidle] @iooomss  omlmilepelglayes
SHSDBHBlo  DOMOAUIGIMIEBBRBl0  2NAMEIGS)o  MIBQaOIEHNHENZD®  HAVE:SOIWOS
20mOUIEIMAODVIBIEM D0, OTVESOl CPHW@ GOUINELIMNBY DOMOQ MIEEUM
20ellMNiMoIE&06Mo, B ld@EMICVIN0, UDall®o, ag)er@IIOClU) ag)amlaies
AA@EI88 96RPNMNAB0  HlAINE9IBLe)0 @eLIEsIcd mailmile joeilglaleel
NEREOBIER  96RPAMUNARESEI  HlAIMBSHIABHND, OMOYNGHBIHSCI
(@IBRUDEEREIHSEWI  6RILIlWAS  MVIEOAICTHIOME®I  @RSIMAIMOTI@  o@B@Ba]la)
M@ HHOQUM Do, BOOMDVo  HSAHUD, DOMOQUIGIMIEBRUD,  2I)ADMLIGUD @AIA
B0 M3 aSlee}mMISAINTY D00 JAIOEOMENZDRMIGM).”;

(iii) (3)-00 9alQIB)afl0) ald0o @IOODWIAM DalQld:la] GalBGHLHENI®I6EN),
GOV

“(3) ayladle joeildles), andleso, @eg)Esl@ ocRe®sslee @Ud AISIG@O
o@RMM ISl H00@  @RSIMUOIMOMIGEID, @RERPOMEWI DV BYBFIGEID
@o®IMBHISlenss  aigeeglerd, c@oegElad  1986-ae1  aldlqudlal  (Vo@@:uem)
eaglerin (1986-0e1 29-00 GHMB EBHY) GOPOIMW HlFlenss aismnsleen 988
20ellMiMoMIG06M  (EIAUBOMMEERUY  MSINIMICI  BRIWIGMICWI  §alQRMM@I)
(@006mM6BBUD a6 |SIOMIIN@I6NM).”.

6. 326-00 QldhloflaY GUdaHo o RIW Qldhlo RS GaIBLO@.—(EIWIM @RBGIeL

326-00 QU flY BUdaHO @IBO@ITN QB0 JdUd Bal@BHEENIIEIT), BRI OY.—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




“326a0). 000068 MBEGUEERUD B:VeM VI MSq {le1oeseMzmIsemaT)—(1) o
@O&HJIm  slsleern @oegi@lad  1986-0e1  aidlaudl@l  (MVoodHeM)  @RBGIGRID
(1986-6)£1 29-00 BHH (1B BYB:]) BOMIMB B PeMOLSVISI8S ~156REI6RI0 BEMOLmY
MoMIHOEMARMID]  NINWER]S TVABHHIB  al}0eq]siilesam mde3uoeeRUB
MSq|le1ese6m® @:vemmileilend somoaodlmmoalaleammos.

(2) (1)-090 Da10IBYl@B 1000dUTl4jI5i88 Mde3UoER8INODI] NIMWEeQ|S
®™QI0BSID @menz BVemMalello  e@MISS}O® EWINOTI@ AUV SN IHAUATY
©21QWACIYTVENM D0 |ICHOEMEM0 @BV 1H00MBS @RI HVemald
O@I0IRIMOASIBHDENBOAIE).

(3) (1)-00 2alQidla] @ISHOOMBS o@o®sslelo MIBEZUVEERUD  LIGla)
@OOM0o  MIGGRUIEERUBBHMAVIMAID] &0y  @TVOBIMESIE,  BYeBdaVlod
@OMOMBASENM DI 0I10OBWELSIAM  TVMBARERSIM, BPOMOo MIGEZUDEBEBUD
Msqflenamma@lmss @oma@l &emadlad @oulle:dla IO M@ BIWMOEWI
B 0Y®6)|ESEIBMIE).

(4) (300 alQidle] (@EISHOOMBS  @OoUNBI00 MDD
B0}MBE)|S} M MUV |HSDIBS BPODMO0 GNOINIMEBRUD MSq flernaem @Iy aauEsdl
9SMSl MSalSl®Ud OOBOBNIEBIENZTMo  BPOMO0  @IOIMIMo  MSq leIeemM@I@d
OMVE@S0IBH00  MEREMEBIIE0  OOMOANGIMION]S  2ERPWIVNEMO  alQILBWEAD
afl$aleao 96M3015106M38;1 @D @O H&®§0ilee1dalnol &M BENIHG)
OMVE@SOIOBOTIO0EWI BROEIBIT BPOMOo DEBPRWNIVOSHMDINHOEWI MVBLEIBIT
@0.2)SH9 MSalsl Mjlaadleedammmyaden.

(5) (M0 Dalaidle] (EIGOMB8 TVBHNIAIOMG  MIBEGUEEBUD
aloellea)m@l@  Hmemailad afll$al AIOO™)MaldHo,  Svemdavlellomdleo
Mfladlosoam ag MSalSle:udesndmie Gowo AEIOMAlWODI@, TVALSIGITY
@oOMOo OflFa1Ies) Bvendailelleong ¢ad oile anomoamMmoey:

ag)MO@, @100 all® alaomM@Ia mmi &:vendaUlella) alo@AIMISSoY
alO@IQUO8 MPRDAID @RAUTVO MTIBBEBEIG).

326enil. moeilmiTmomIB:0emM@MI@ HIVB:3CIWIOS dOMOUIEIMIEEBRUD.—(1) DD
@OERLPDOBIOL! AUQITUOBUD LlorLil@aM oBO®I0} EYSlOEMMINOWI0 HAVE@SOlH6)
D@AMSaISISUd  @YOElIBHIRMDI, g)MNIT DV @YY (@ ISHI0CAI BRI
SlYlenss 21568303 (@100CMO 00=l@OB§HOQIAM B QB MIEBRUY
0022l@OHHOQUIM @MO6N).

(2)  @elmimemMie:0emaMO@ll  eNIMeR|S DD GPELOVOTID
SIENS8emO  BUOLBIT  GO@IVAWo  (EINILIODIERS8  neRE®®lE Ml
@IBO0MBVEMI @OX 2RAMEIGUD  BHOOIGHANID]  MIBQalleM@IMS88  ag)elo
@UWIB0068838)0 AV SOlBS 9eN30oleaM @6,

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




(3) &@MVE»30les), @OMPAIVDLISERSIM, 6)21BGIFTVHEM @AW,
BUDaHo, MILIIMIMEMIBOEMARMODI] ENIMWER|S DV EPELPDOHIGEI) ETAVAWo
(@I0eNILIODIERSS MEQeMEsIERe MA@ 10600 M@ Mld:Hla IMRI® 23O@EIBUd
MlBajedleamnm@lmy eniaweq]s MMISle@d anenslad mlary ©ens eldHo ©al@@d
SO @D §alelaf 6.21QIQRM@I6M).

326l. 82IB@IGla) moellmie mmlmila joeilgleded @oUilei® o@eradavlessd
06&N0)MMBGIMBS 2OMOAIEI®I0.—(1) OAVESA, Halomemosglmilenes Mldegutla)
@ld000, GAUAMIOly]  @oeilmiEErUd  ee@®RO)M®IEMI  MIAGlay  CUOLIOWDY
mledHailosnmalemo @md «dlad aymindlejoeildlessd @ooulla® ag@mmilessd
M@DMBIM  ag)plo  afls)e81es@lo  a@emssleloe  aldlrLEER8IOS®0, BaNISMD,
0GERIOME, QAIKQITVIWo, @RYUDI@] BREEIBIT nEQEMEsIEe MNdalMo ag)MlIeS
9SOHMNABBN0 HOHQUUDHNIBBN o DOMOQUIGIM|MeNM3ODIBlHM @I6M).

(2) (1)-00 Qaladloflorl QIIMNGUD Eloaeilae)M «GOMO0ISlOm@Y0
GAM OAV@SOIBS @ODVIVo IV  BHOWICOD  al®IMID]0o  OJal1D]@d
SO @A o il® aRAODOQIM 6.

326l @8 odlavieodl  eniaweels  0I0IuNe:08.—(1) 630600
mladlgjoeilglage  moeilme  IBGIGIEH@,  BUOGIOEMo,  W@INo,  TVROEMo,
MoMIh06Mo @MY HOQIFIV@  og)MIU@NOD]  NIMWeR]S  BIVAIMEBRUD
M@BMOIOF 0 }B6NEn0 FGIUWIBEN0 @@ &.alfl] AladlecmM@IM 60600 moeilmy
D@aldBHMIo M@BH:ENZ WIMVAB afly MluRUDIEHOMEM0 @YD MIURADIBeHaM
AV CLRIOIBHENZMIMI6NT):

a@)MO@, @MA oblaldy MVBLeIB Mloes MU LjlSI88alaHo, TVALIA
Mluaily]  Oloaslemeendud  &oemm  MloLs  SHYemavldd  mlvnilesom
aloSlgoom®o6).

(2) ®0600 moellmy 9@aldBsMp @IMVA  odlmy  mymlmilejoellglensd
@ROLIBIT oBOMBIEN0 @OoUIlB{® aB2RBMBMIEH9I ag)f)o AOTVOMISLIIo @PAINVIM
@R®Be; MMUEI @egEldd mMladlajoerilgl @loymomlesjeedanm @pomoo
S0rIws0llmssi|erId M@ EH6eN3mI6e).

(3) a@oomileno moeilMy 9@aldGHM (2)-00 Daldldhla] (@000 QIKQIMNO
0210015188 WIVG bl @os@eaM®I@ all¢a1010;ETI@O@, @D, (@ IMIAdTVo
@PMIB) LODMAIMo allPEWISIHYS] MHDVSIECHHENBGIEN):

ag)MI@d, MluRil® TG MO@ e®IeO FAlAINVOMIMEUDaHA @IAVA adlm)
@RS EHMDI@ 0fl$al AIO)OWIOT AO@EA BROM®O all® DDSIBHNNAIIM o I0SIBS),.

(4) @38 afdlavge adle@yo 538 enil QIB{ld (@IB3latoElaflclesymm ailwo
8a10@MIBI@] 3:)51(RlB@ID] BHEMBSVBEI DVSIHHOAM 6.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




(5) @VA by @PsVeeIm®  alldalaioyomm  eoglemdieo
mfledlescam  mege®sleo  MSalSlé:des  Gowo  QAIOIO®, @IMVA  adlmd
@PSWBNM @O0 APOMOOTI@ afl§al aoyo@l@ crglmy mmimilejoelgloilcd
MIMI88 «@O@I0} GILAIMAI M@ HTV(ES0IB6) AllTvE@leeQRMM @M.

(6) qUBLHITIEMI  @PERIBIT  @ORINGOLIERElI VAL
al}06|siailesmm 203\ MIBEZUOEBRUBBHMITVIMAODI], e joeilgleseo
aBeOO®Brlelo Moelmy 9@aldBH:eOMm @ReLIEITd @oelmy 9@BaldBHOOS WEMeT,
@OLIBI T AYHBISITMEMI BFIOTMD} BISHNMEDI BOD OB SISENRBOS OSNGHOS
@RI HOBAUUDENIHO @IMVA oblM) BRSVENM@I@ MIaTY o« 3AEHDOCO
BOUWBHMICWI BSlNI0BHIQUM 6.

7._327-00 Qldhla{lN}ald00 aJOND Qidla] BalBHO@B.—EIWIM @esgleel 327-00
QB l0) aldh00 MO JOIMM Qldla] BalGBHEENZMIGN), BRMOIDOY.—

“327. auoa0ellmeanud  Moealea)M@IM)e  MledHa llaeym@lmie  moeilmy

DM lIBHALNBS  2O®EIGU.—(1) eemaindelmiEnrsloc  @oeeeaIndelmicErslo
@alBHSSHONI®  1NIBalld  @OLlMmIEEB8loe  MVoRAlEOM@IMITI  alseerslerid
066MICRINGSlee MBI ofISI88 (1800600 @LIEIT OIVESOl Mlate:@aHl o)l
OlBOIM MBaIISLIIBREMI GO QlLla |OBell0 MIOODIEMSBS (I1BDE: NIl 680
MoRO6MIB:680 ME22dlB:AlEH6MI0) 630600 MILIMY O@aIIBBOMFWI0 BHSADIEN).

(2) ermremss milMdud GOl  MVoROMIBUD  ag)elo
Ma@OM}e ol M@  qu@HleenemmPe  OIVESOl EPM@ VAo
8a10EMISIAVINO@  MlBE3UBleaM @Yo of)slPo  @PEEBROMIBY  ALOLIOIDY
L2223l B0l HENBMMI6).

(3) mmlmilgoeilgl Mleoudlajlgiss &laiMEeIBEH0 BD0I0}BIBEHD
@O0 MOLlMIEERUY ag)Ble|OMI@ cUDAIAlENM@IMe Mleso e.aIgRM@IMMO
80600 MmOEIlMy 9@aldBH:Mo 2ISEERSICEID  HOENIGLINGEIEEId  Mlatid:daH]ofl5188
(@1000 MILIMIEBRUD BAIBMIOla)} MledHalleassmmosm).

(4) (3)-090 Dalaid)eflorl AIMNGUD LIoLIlBNIAM  BOMIVIBOSWY0
GAM, BOMV@S0les @YV ©OIDVI@M  BIOWIOTH®e  alBIMOD]o  Ba D@D
SUQIODH®MOD ail® 2 RACYDIQRM@I6M).”.

8. 328-00 Q) N8BS EEENT]. —(I1WIM @YB:FleRI 328-00 Qo |l@d,—

(i) 208M@ UBlBHBHODIM ald0o @IHYLO@IMM MOAHRIM@ UBIBaH B0
GalBCHHENZMIGM), BODMIVDY:—

“@oeilmieanud  Mloesw  eaguM@IM  @oellmy  9E3aldIBHHMIRIEWO
9SAMUOMAIEWI MIRAVHNIOMIARICWI 98B B:IA”;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




(ii) mleinllenss aaInnleel “a@BOOLlo al0lVO6ER8IOS
9SAMOMIAIEWI  MIAMVENHIOMIAIEI” o)  QAUIDNHUBBS  ald0o  “@deilmny
D@ lOBHMINIECWI  BOOLIBIT  o@O@®B;IEo  aICITVOERSIOS  OSAMUAMIAOIECDI
@IDAVEHIOMIAIEWI” o) AUIBNGSBo “alQle0d M0ellMiend Mleso ealgRmMm@Iay”
ad)M QOBNGHUVBE) ald0o “@IellMieEnud Moo §a1QM@INT” ag)M QAUOLIGHBlo

GalBBHSENZMI6M).

9. 329-00 QI lMNe1d00 o RO Qldhle] GaIBHLO@.—IWIM  GOGQIE!

329-00 QAU ITY ald00 @INS|O@ITN Qld:lo] G2IBEHOENEMILT), GVGIWD):—

“329. Q@@Bqgsl  moeilmy  @uosuemo—(1) 80600  mMlaVlejorilglayo

MMl @B @IeBLOMSS ag)plo Allsieglad adlange smamL e (3eslad Mlano
QIoemle’y mundalmesrgl@d mlange aQ APEIV®MO aldlmvossgl@d mlame enanyMlel
OB3IS6ERUd,  QeMIRy UM @R,  MIB/YBUD,  aldBofls VMo @EBBUD
DIOENDAUDIOS  SHOOOVI@M  @IBGUWM  SHAUISODI@  MIeMO  &AVESO
8alomEMISIVINI@  Mlad:@Batilajlsiss  meQemssleno  quoeissnglad  mleamo
eUd®IGly]  @oellmEERuwd @@l  cURIGIEOIMMIMSS  (@0lle:06mMeBRUd

aB3B6)o |SBODENZ®IEI).

(2) (1)-90 Dalaida] @100 GUDAIDLY ®Oo®IGlajlsiss moeilmeerud
WAl NS E66|SIOD® TVoMIGEeMOMIEMI MIdmmodeEmOmIEMo GaleNE]

B)B0613)BaI0B:}BH BRI af) M BNGEWI 21QIM aldSIgoOm@®I6M.”.

10. 331-00 QI lNBS EBERWOM.~EIWIM @YB:GIeEl 331-00 QIB:)q [|@d,—

() (1)-90 9l {0 aldh0o IO DalQldla] BalBGHOENB®IEN),

@RIV —

“(1) 0, Gal, eilmezel @OLIBI@ «Olea@d HEYUIEE TVoMIB:06M oJoy
eom®e MMMVl @ (EICBLABIMEEOMI OGO Bl EIseeM @)l
06B0I0MBSOMOD MMIMla oeilgl, BROMOo ¢JOFIEB:E80 MVVBOIEBRESD (@ ITIER®

A3 N ileeymM@IM8S al1@RLGB:0d MMBWEMM M@E;] BOQSIEHENZ®I6M.”;

(ii) @IS0 aldh®o GalBB96)]S (1)-00 DalQldlo{lMIBUdAHO @I |O@IIM

9alQldhlo|idU0 BalBEHHENBMIEN), BRIV D).—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




“(lag) 0600 mMladlejoeilgl@ge  moeilmymemis:oemamla)  ealendl
MMl @B @IBRUOODIME:EO™I  al}0GOMO  @GPMIEWILIMO®  (TV|BI0E
SOENBEOMENRM0 BYAUUABIEE 2013-081 3 980Q Q) ©aNA BBIMIMBETVAHD
@ (SOMMaloommil  ®m e @Glalaum,  dlanoenileilegauad @Y
dlemgldend ©@oeg (2013-0e1  30-00  GHMB  OOBHY)  (@ISH006RD @Al
AlgIN@B@  (@ISHO06AO  aldSOMIEMI  V@IOAIBRES  MERIMEWI QUMY

@A CHENRMI6N).

(1eni) (lag)) 2alQid)a] @I®000 mMladlejoeilgl eodzedeaym el
MALeIdlem mmed @oMAGIDlgpe® acgemslele  @RYAIUDIEERUBESID

9ale@IUIBHIND aldSIBSOEY.

(1ardl) @oellmimomIie:06m (@ IIBOMMEERUBLSID Bslemm) &lsaeym
mjamoe  @laled ®engld  MladlaI®ao®  Elaled  eIRMISMBIM  ERHO)

allmleorilesym @l 80600 mmlavle joeilgl@ie mmdwemm M@EHEN3®I6N).

(2w @0eilmnimoi@:06m (@1 MNEBRUBBHIDI ™o T
Dale@oUlajfloym o 2g)OMO@D B0 |0Ud allallw &006MEIRBITD
Da eI HHIOD AW clalwlad @0eilnymomie:06m (@IQIBOmMEIRUD
al)M0EleeM @Iy MLOWIMOD ag)BJo MSalSloés)o olaSle joeilgl
MfleoleeeenEmos:

a)MI@, VABLHIOIHNR  MWBE  @OMAT]  WLPOD®  @I®  Gjall
MOQIOOAUUIOMIMe  GaleNsl  MOGIAUIDBNGHEWI  DalCIWIBENGHEWI  6)21QIM

aloSIgjoOm®o6M.”;

(iii) (2)-090 9aladl@d  “(1)-00 DalQldlojield000 MUORI  QilE26mIalmMo
£.21Q)EIUOUDY” ag)aM ENIBEFIMI0 BRBHOMIMNI0 2flaM@BTIML0 QI10E6EBUDB0 ald:0o
“1 ag) al0idle] @I:000 Gl BHEOEMBOMBIUIR" a)0M ENIOLOQI0 BREHOo

BRHHOQI QUIENGSBlo BalGCHOENBMIG).

11. 332-00 QI&)a 0¥ GUDaHO o DI Qo NBUD B2IBLOD.—EIWIM @BYG:QIeL!

332-00 Qo flY BUdaHo @ISO QB o JdUd B2lB@BHEENIIEN), BRI OY.—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




“332a0). Mo@B®  M0LlMIToaV&H06M  alELD@I&Ud  quNdailee@d.—

laSle |oeilgles), @:memailad @oEld:000 GIO3MIMIB6}E:EWI BRI TUAEI
@100 BYQIUDIDQ|SIBHEDI ©alQMaldHo, NCQOMEXIL0 @BEGUD TV|WoBEOEM
N2 IMAR@OD] €213, @R@MOo MEZUD AVWoEOMIUNIAIMEEBUD @PoUIlBOla)
@1BH00MB8  MININWMBSBe QAUUMOBSBe @PMITVAl,] MVAHHIB DO®IGLIEI
1306 S)0ilE2) 86001 203N MIBEZUOEBRUBHE) allew@anol MO}

22LlMIMoMIB06M alRL@IGUd Mu0da fleedammas).

332enil.myalavle Joeilgl almlanol al0l@UDIWM@)0 MldleHemallo

23860 ]S16OMENE®InMAN.—aMIMile oeilgldlleael moeilmiruoi@:0em  (@IIBG®M

B8l alELOIGS8e @RAIUDIROID MIMEBEMLEERUD  aldella)led0enmsle, mlelnllenss
T @06BUWEHMIVIMAODIFNEM (@ IAUICOMILNMEMIMI  MSa{lEINEIMHDMI0
900 SOOI B GRIESOD] (HDDOQ al@lGUDOWM™@Yo mldleemal)o
MSOMMMGIMIAUUDINID  (BAHO6MEBBUD aBB6|SICOMET® MMMl jorilglayes

DOMOQIIGI® @06,

3320.01BDl:810S  DOMOQUIGIDIEEBBl0  3)Qdhi@68BUd  Ol@a]ods

21PM@INMNBS 2 10BleMHlBH68RSB)0.—(1) OV GPERLPOBIOL!  AUUTLOGSINS

aBOMBSIE0 LIoALINEAD @PELIEIT Salommunelanslenoe senv@angleno aoellmyo
aellosydloye, @886 eneg®lad  MleaHallend ogmmlal 9ud6q|eoswss
@0ellMIToMIG:0emMaR@O®I]  ENITWER|S aBO@EIIER0  BIQBIMIGRI, VoMM

QllI063BUD oBO@IVOUBBN0 HTVE@SO! MMBa10eS: GlEa 003 6.21QIINIE.

(2) mmlmilgjoeilgleas) VBB B:0e106:0e1BRSI@  a1)08q|Siilesam
203MIBE3UERUHS allewmd, (1)-00 alQidla] (@IS0  EloALIMEBRS)0

BQBIMIEBRS0 OlGe 033 ©21QRMN BYBBUBHE) o ldOIEMIaHlB0 M@EI0MM @I6M).

(3) @OQOVOWRVHS  BBINGMO  MaHSGAI  VENIIBOAN  MOOYNI@D
(J0}BRUDIBOMISEO MM }AQYMOE@I  (1)-00 Dalldhq] (@ISHI00 @YW GO}
Glee|0B3 M@BIM a@ODIVIBL0, BQIUNIaINOMIMWBEA@D, al@IMIDI0o B)al QIO

@0 alile M@H: UleHlBOe|eSEMEMIET).

332al.  @0elMITMISHOM EHHMBEBRUBHS  MUAla MBS MIAAVSNIBHE)

(I6@ILMBOMID  QI0INNGU0.—(1) mMlailejoeilgles), aVBHeId  9emEeeM

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




10

21368BU3BHNI al}06e]Siileanmm mdyYmMIde3ueRUBELe0  allew®MID], 8HO3le:\™
@OElMIMoMIB06M GHH(BEBRUD @OOEJEHIEd MIdmNId22e’M MLOLIERUB ag)MIQIES
&®I3SOY0) @®MVlEe)MAIdEE MG SSIQI0ENHGERID  HOSAUHEBI  GHUM
AURLMIBE80 92U |OSWIBBM0  DBIG M@0 o IAIAIMOS}OMIOOSS  OY

G@IOONIaNMEBRBo  MNMTIGIUIOMN @I6).

2) oo oeilgles), e @Bley®  MRIlMIMoMIB06M  BH(13633UB
@06LJes] @ MIGEMIBd222_M MNLIBRUY ag)MIQIIOS H@ISSIOD @IAMVIENIMAUOIOS
cHAO®IM}o Qllemas@®IMie BAeNEl aldBB6®Ud, dSlaunelanrud, Aloeavglou)
MUDEOIEBRUD, MVPa] GaHI WD, ablMilee@ eETIMlou) TVDH:OEERUD @S6ERI

9alEIN (IGO0 (EIBWOLRMGOAMIW MoQIlWIMERUD oGBS} @IE.”.

12._333-00 Qidoflanss  6EEULOGI. —lWIM @&:gleel 333-0o  Qlds)q fl@d
wlelnflenss aoiun @@lead (1)-0o 9a10Ida o] EROSOAHIGSENEM0  @D(IB:000
@oeedls (1)-00 DalQld)qa|lM}EUdH0 @IOPOIAM DalQldla] B2lGBHHENZMIE),

BROIQO):-

“(2) @IOMIMIBYe OO MM (@l Glaiarve  oemiIssleno
mdladle oeilglo@  @rdldllesntem,  eeeiu@MlgPom  o@o®ilee  MUOLIOWD
moleillédo BSOS B0}  alClaldSle@O  BOMG2I0GRID VoISl {lee0ad
al0SIRJOOD®}0, BOOMO0 @YEBI  BROMD0 alBlaldSIIOS MLIISH:EMO QOQIlSODI@D
@em aoeilmge cIRMIBlEMIBAINTY 904 [o6He6ME®0 MMIMSle joeilgl Mlumiilesymm
a0y m@desl myadlale oeilgl ana@eisqsioolalgiss moerilmye cuoaIGleeMAIGEHSI

BBV UBCHI B B)E)BAICOENZDAIEN):

a@)MO@, @O0  aflAVGUD  MILIMIMOMIGHOeMOMIMNI88  LOOBM.O
8.21100lBMHENIUD B0 MIOBHIHIM  ldSIEPOM®Pe @@ MIMIMSle oeilg]

MIBBZUOIES0 (13000 MIMVBI0ODI] BPSVBLHENZTRAMI6EM).”.

13. 334l QIdo {|0Y ald®o0 a RO Qldhja] B2aIBHLO@B.—a1WIM BR&:Gleer 334mil

QB {lNald:00 MO alO@IAM Adsla| GalBGHHEMZMIET), BOGIWD):—

“334mdl.  moellmiavomi®oem  enenEleoad  @afle:oemo.—(1)  6306@0

mladle oeilglage  "@moellmiuoI@®06em  aN6NE” o) GalGl@ B0  anens

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




11

0}aflo:0leresnz®i, @GP AVBHEHIQ DENBILHIMM 2ISEEBUIEHND  alj06)|Siileeymm

203RMIBEZUDEBRUBBHSI BVMIAVIONIWV] HEB:E00%0 6)21BQYENITRIAIEN).

(2)  moellmymomie:06m  aNENEIGRIBS) @IS |OIMAI  QIEQT
QU BHHENBIE), BRI O):—

(ag)) @2EIMIMMIBOEM  LlorLIMEBRSMODI] NINWE]S alleocO
8alMI@JIWICWI DSIBSI@ @)B>dUD;

(eni)  @oellMIVoMIBO6M  (EIAUIBOMEBRUBENODI] BB |BOY
BM2aH@  ©OMVGaemaVlenilellgl  (Ml.ag)V.e@@) anenslad  mlmie  eIcloy
MoRINIMEHUV;

() v @YAUICMICEIEeID] LIGly] MIGaIeMMUBaHle] @)B:d680
DEROMBIIEN0 TVoERIAIME:ESI;

() VBH9IB MIBEZUTILOIM MEROD®EB;IE0 @YErBUD.
(3) 206NE I8 |OWIM GBRYQIUDIEBRUDBHI],—

(ag) ooellmeEnsles cUA@ICIEO@,  CUDAIOEMO,  DINOo,
al@laloriMo, MVoMI@06Mo, MIBMMIBLEMo o)A UBEILHSWISS, of)MNIMS DTG
DO@o alAlAl®eSIOMOSOD, ag)p)o BOLIMITVEMIB:06M (IQIBOHMEBBUDB)]0;

(end]) HHOVIHNNOD 20eiln§IMoMIE&06eMO®IMIIUD RO
9aldH06MEBRUd QI06BRM@IMe MNJa leaymM@IM]o;

() @oellnimoi@:0em@DI@  oBB6e|Sldleeim  =laimeeo0}es
&slage  @ndlage  adelleflesmalmeasnElonss  aicludleImomlmie  ©:00§6u0aH
All®aVM aldlaloSle:udH6)0;

() VABHIB BoUTlB:Ale] MIRIMITVMIE:06MAAID] ENITWEa]S
DEROO®BIIERS (@ IQIBOMMEBBUIB0

DaleWIUIBHNENMEBMIEM.”.

14. 335-00 QI fld) 0ld00 oI Qldle] €alBLOT@.—(EIWIM @OGQISL
335-00 QUs}a lNJald:00 @IBS|O@IMN Qld:la] GalBEHOENEMILT), GOMIWD):—

“335.:S3)0S}o QI06MILRL NI IMEBRBIOS@0 _al@lddo QOO
MWGHlENMDIMBS  90moAElMlo.—(1) 8600  HSWIOSlo  Qldemlesy
MO INOBIOMRDIe alBlTVOo AUOMI@OI] MV}EHIBEOMEM0 @PMIHG alBlaVOODY
moellmio QLo -j0lWIGHE@I  MB8BYBHERI  BHODIBNGHEWI  &alQIMIVIBNH@0
@eLIBlad @O IBlVOO® a@emaslee moeilmipe alellejol@oemd  ®m8806M

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




12

SO HHIEMI 92 1BRISMILNNS @PMIGlE00®I0l86)B@]0 6.216QY6ENEO)
DSNWIHSEWI 6OBAUUDBHIVHMREWI DOMOUIGI®|ROD|BleeM @6

(2) (1)-00 Dol {leOel AIIMNGUD cGomssleo @RUD elocailspeiary
BENIDWIR]SOM@,  EITVO®  EloLINOMIHNG  GMOGMI  NDOAIGAD  (NV|EIQUIGAD
@OMIAVALa] HAVE@SOIEHHI, HTVESO! @EIBDB0 2AMEIO|SIOTI® DEEPWAVOEMNI
@OOMOo ERYBOS GAT GOV OISO @YUM all® 2 RAGDIRM @I6M).

(3) (2)-00 9alQIB)a 1000 2RACDOLSISISS alle, @O OB
olool 0Jo@ odolmedl  Glarmvomlmsslad  GRSEHENMEMe @R Id:000
@OSWEM D@ Qfl9al IO}, HAVE@SV], FPWIWBOLODIOD ag)S}EeHIARMM OY
MSalSldwdes)  @oo QIOIOYD) allwoml@, (IR lq gV FEXIRCPle MSalSleud
@YVoREIBHENBMMI6N).

allvodle:06mo.—0D  QIBflOm)  BDAIVDICMICRISHID], '@SHuDd’, 'aloemilesy
MN0alMo’ oM  QDBNGHUWHS  @INOGNo  1960-0R1  CHOS  HSHSlo
QI06MI2RIMNIa IM6EB8le BBQI@ (1960-0e1 34) @RAIDHS M@BLWIS88 GOE®
@PAMNERUY DeN0IABlHaM™MI6).”.

15. 337-00 Qo lY 01800 o AN Qldhla] BalBLOT@B.—(@IWOM BYG:Gleel 337-00
Qe lN}eld00 @IOY aI0IAM Qld:la] BalBEHOENEMIEN), GOGIVDY.—

“337.9a16@0Uila]  6QISBo  aIOMIAVNLIEBSICLIGHS]  SBLIDUDIREERSICLIGHS
B91H0IAN G OSV@.—(1) VIOV a@O®EBIEN0 MV, 21003, HWMILIOND), B2OISDD,
06qRo0ag, afls, QIO  MNdaIMo, @YUDI@! G@eLIEICd A MUNIaIMERUD
oMl mlmss aellneelo, ©ald®] GOYIHENLAILRGUD, GO, MO,
©al0M)TUOLI0, REIDUVO@o @@ ReINIBWo af)MInilseanglerins) 6391666
89186310018 @PMAIGlBNGEWI BRHLJEIT @POMO0o aldlroeargl@d mlan @oomoo
9ale@IUila] OQIBBo  BLENUOM  @OMAUGIEN®EDI  BROLIBIT  @PGIM]
BD06MMIB}BHEWI §)alQYOM @ ldSILIOCH@IE).

(2) (1)-00 Dol florl QIQIMNGUD eloilacm oBe®I00860dWlo
GAM OMVE@S0lEs BOQYIVIDo B IV BIOWICH®Io a)MMIT  BPAUGI MO0
031D SHUOIOOMIW oil® 2lAOHOQRIM @6,

(3) OV S0lBE), a@OMmBIENe ald® G0IWIERIEE6) BISTICRICHSO
o®0)0ilerIcHeed  @PeLIEIT  NEQEMSsIER0  HIDMTUALIGOINEGHEI  @EE]HIEd
£2e1000WEBRSIGRIEHN0 MEIIMELlo 8913000 BPMAIGIBHNMM oBO@®IEe 66)alBe]d
SHGENI0 @RBELIBIM NEQEMBIIER0 MIBREND BVSDENQIIEMO MISIAIOBMI BV6E|EsITD
MBS0  ©aIQPRAIEMO  BMISITY  MEEUM  BOOMO0  alOITVOODIONG  OSHEWIESI
860 BQUUDHHIOBMIEGSI MIBEGUTESIMI6).

(4) (3)-00 2alQIB}e }01B00m88 MIBEGUD0 LIEly] aBO®O008}0 MIBEGUo
eldla] o@¢ Glacvomlmssla @oomoe MIde3UEERUE aldelleeeeMz®mio BVOMOo

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




13

MIB63UeBRUD  aldeileeymM@I@  @o@ouwd  all¢alaoiEBl@o@,  eaVWSal,  (2)-00
9alQldla] (@I8000 MVld:Olee0aRM  oGOMEBIE0 MSaISIB:UWBEE Gowo QIVIOD,
@OOMOo &&ale], Syen] @PERR@ 0 MOAWYEBBUD BRSWOENEGHEWO  MISIBHELI
@OLIBIT MlB60 §.21QYLBHEWI 6).2I6RYMNBMo DI BAUNE] QIO DLOOAMA .alela]
@PIsI@ MM o EOMSICHHENZAIEM).”.

16. 340-00 Q1) {ld) 0l o@D Qldle] G2I@LO@.—(EIWIM GOBQIE!
340-00 QAU I ald:00 @INS|O@IMN Qld:la] GalBEHOENMEMILT), BGVGIWD):—

“340. ©aIO@MAVOLIEBRSIGLIGHNI  MV|HI0S  MOLIERSIERICHD  adeilmio
alellesjoloymaloss  Mleoowmoe.—(1) moellmye symM@Imeaiens] 963utleoaq]s
muneliergleenslod  a®moallerld BISDICRID  Sald®MUALIECOMI  @IMIVIBL0
a@eo®lee  moellmie  alkilesjolwideo  alellea|olen QAIODIEHSILBEO
OBBLHERI BHOMBNGHEDI B)Slajl MS}HEWI @PSELIBITD BROMO0 (@ IQUOD]BUD
821 @I HO06MAINUEGEWI §).aIQYOD aldSIEJOCD@IE).

(2) N3P LfIIB8O} (@12:00600 BROEIEIT BAVE@SO! al}06)e]Sialla)
MIBERUDEERUD  BPMIVAIGS)0  @REPOD DIOMIVIBle  aBOMEIERo  MV]EIOS
muoeleerglad  moellmie  aleileajol@ie:e@o  alelleg)oleny  AIODIEHSIHB:EI
MBBHEWI  HOMIBNHEWI  B}¥la)l MIS}HEWI GOOLBITM  BOODO0 (IO
821QIM @) HI0EMMAIAUIGEWI §21QPIND aldSIRJOOD@IE).

(3) (100 alaid)efloricad (2)-00 DalQlB)a{lOLIEO  QIEITUNGUB
oBOOBIERe  @OUE  LloailaleINY  GENIOWOE|SO@,  EITVOR®  ElocelMODIe ]
GMIGMI  NVOQIGAD  VJEOAUGAD  @OMIMVAl]  HAV@SOIEHOD AV SOl D
@QIUDOBIGEISNID] (I B0 @PUIE006|SIOMI®  OEBPRWAVLNBMI  BPOMOo
@YBLOS BAG OTDAVA®o BPRIDI00 O IAUOD BYSIQUM ail® 2 RAGMOQRM@I6N).

(4) (3)-90 9alQIB)a] @I:000 2RACDOS alle OO 23OMIQ GG
DO allmedi GlaIromIMSSIM GPSWEHHENZMo @@ 1000 GRS HNIM DIED
afl$al  UOOWII@, V@S0l BOWIWBOLODINO  ag)S}EeOIAWM  a@BOOBEIEI}0
MSalSldUBHE) BoWo QUBIOD, GoldMVldaHMB MSalSld:Ud @RYOoEleLSMEMIMIEM).”.

17. 340ag) QI3 I0Y 0100 a RO Qldla] Bal@BOD.—(EIWOM @B:Qlee! 340ag)
QB l0) ald00 @IS JODIMM Qldla ] BalGBHHENZMIGN), BRMIDOY.—

“340ag). 20ellNGA0 2101600 QilaudEmess AINIMHENESI  23LI0UDREBRSIRN0
£2LIGMIOMNG SN0 MledHa loamM@lm8s8 Wleodwmoe.—(1) WIS®MIVIBe Sald®)
RLINIBPOMICEID LEIDVDOMIGRID ReIGLIGMIIEEID MelMIENd 2101600 allrudeesy
QUNIOOE9E80 QLI 2J0lWIGHEI M8BHEWI GOMIGEISS NLIlMMElo B9IHNGEWO
aBOMB Lo &AM M) GP@ICRISs HAISSe &B9;HOM  @PMQIGIHNEEWI
@oogislad  mellmselo  @OOIGEILS 9120  BPMAIGlBNEEWI, NEYEOMEsILlo
QllwoM@d el aelNDIE6BEWI BREEIEITD, GPOMO B0} (EIUODTI 6.21QRM @I

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




14

@YHOWHBL0 Mol e6)eo MIeOIUH6HHEI MlBdenInul 9660
8 1Blo |96 @I ©.21QYINB al0SIRJOCYD@®I6N).

(2) (1)-00 DalQidle] EIMHOOMBS B30} Qo BHIPOUNMIlenilglo 20myo
SDLJOOM@RODIBIEOM ®IRIEM).

(3) (1)-90 9alQIBa{l@ lEIDBUTIGEM Qo S2IQRMN  aBH@I0IBL0
SQMNI INOTICM@ o IBIMNOD]00 OV BIOWIHODIo  BVMal@IMID] o
031D H0IIHIMBS o illeio @YD AONVOMIT BHJOWIHD@Io 630} AUBHOYMITD
S0ll@IemMB8 S M@E;] UBld:Hl B9 |ESEME@MO6T).”.

18. 34001l Q16:)a {I0Y 100 a RO QIBH)a | GalBHH@.—(EIWIM GB:qleel 340l
QUBl0) aldh00 @O JOIMM Qldhla] BalGBHSENZ®IGN), BRMOIDOY.—

“340enil.  moellmiend  allaLBEEQINTONENEBI  OHIENZ)Ca 10D M@IAT
9a16WIUIla) QI0aOMo  ailSles)Sieeele  &engiadsello.—(1) DD  G@PERLPOHIT
SIS B0 BHIQBIOe O2IYMMBIMISS DBRUDBOIMINSEWI BO}BNBOMINSEI
moeilmiead  aflavd=ely AUMIMENESD B ldMIMUOLIOMIERHSEI  Sald®iMIoomI
PNOSCWI  BHSOMIS@INIBAIIGHIMEMI  @RLOAID  @@EI3000 MIEHHlasmla)
Dal8@IUIa|@IMNIEUDaHO DIDIOD: Baldd:}MBEMI @YSHEMAN MPAOIDI] MoUd]B6I0Dd
G&006MAB8 S0} QUMD GRS IMAD@OO®, OAV@SOIEWI DD
@QIUDOTIGEISNID]  OTVES0l  @RUIGD060 s  mmimdlgjoeidlales &)
9BROWMNEMI, VNI  MMMIDIRNOS olBADVI@ B0 &80  Gatoeflm)
9ERPWMNEMI  allSloajSieaenzml, @oWle:odlo@igs queni  adlaillatemad
222lV6(EQ M)MBaldSB a0ILIVIBHSENIGRAIE).

(2) @OEM]aHEMDDIT) GUdaHO, DD @PRLOVOTIM &1F1eN8s ago®eslelo
BQBIMIGBRUD  §2IQIM  QIdaOMo  BPSRIBIT @IMald@o  DaleIUIajlsieenzary
aflvojmilesom  mpP@MI®  &ooemmeersay  avent  ablaillaen@d  asdlaiesglay
BENIDWIO]30@,  @PEREOM  allSles)SIO®  QIaOMo BRI  @IMald@o
BB ZOAUM Yo, BREJITDMaldrHo, @YD  QIlSIM@BEH6N3®IMI6EM).

(3) QAPOMOBIOMFEWI WOMaII@OTHIOMIEWI DSADEHI BOEE]8H@D
@Ol MIMIEEMI @M A ilSle) 2)S;EM® @PAIBLE—

()  QDAOMERD  IMAlI@ERI  HENMBIOSHFIMW  BHIVEMNAOD
MoMB0806)0la] ©@O®IO8  GO6UINEI  @OOIDlo)odoens  &03  EMISITY
M@ HIDMD0; HHISIOD

(ii) 63 BSOM}BS &O06EMOMIaMN@Ie0, emoslmil@d
QUBSMRLSDIFI88 MPEOD  VARODIMSSI@B, @EIUBEE  alOWIUIMSSOY
alO@IQI00 MPDAID @AV MTIGHIDDIo

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




15

DD Qo] (100 aBOO®ESIEI}0 AIaOMEAI WIMaII(MCAI B6NOGHIOMIBS DOMOQT
a1}06)aS30ile60m aldslgloam@™oe.

(4) adlSI®a)SIO® QIaOMOBIGRID @IMald@ODIERD MOLlmIGRd 2101600
@oeglml@d  allovd2esend 988 aLVMBAEEBSI®E,  QIDAOMERD  IMlI(@EAD
allslenjsieam @ud, @PEGate OMVEGSOlIWeLIEIT, BP0 allSles)Sieadd s
OME@SOlo®  @ROlDlesem®lo, DD  @PERLPVOMIMW KM  ag)S}eedamM
aBOMBsIERo MNSalSlGUdBE) BoWo AUOIOD, AUIOMOTIHAFEWO WIMAI@OMIHAZEI
950@eS 62le1ail@d @oellmio, 21018 @PeRIBI@ allrude’e’iearud Mleso §.algRMIN)
OaVE@S0l Msalsl qufle:dlesssmmie merem MIEse S2UQMTIM8S  ealelQlo
@QPIoo OB  Salwoom  afll@p  emVEsOl  9sadl@d  mlanye
EDMSIBHENIOIAIGT).

(5) QAU2AOMEAI WIMalI@EAD GOSN MoV @@ Geltlo
02ICQEMRMP  @6EROM  LIGlENM @i  MlMMoI&:06m  anenileelas) aloal
QUQCHNHENBOIAI6E).”.

19. 345-00 Qlr)o lM)88 GRERWML.—(1WIM @YB:QIeEI 345-00 QB {l@3, “GPWIWI,
340ag) Qdlflong CWDI@@ 96 SIAMIEPEBIM” a@)M  QIOBEBUBBN0
aflanO®IMI0 @OEHOBIMI0 BOHHOODIMI0 ald:Oo “GP@OIUBHS), HD @PELPOHITD

DOQIAISOM}o UBlAHOH@IMo M@BIDISILPODEBHIT” ag)M QUOBNE:Blo  allamaio
GalQCHSENZMIEM).

20. 34520) o) O Qldlo] B2IBHO@.—@IWIM @YBFIeE! 345-00 Qldo{lay
GUDaHo MIBY|OIMM Qldhla] GalGEHOENZMIET), GRMIWO).—

“3454a0). oile 2AOOM @ qVoenNITWla) QI0ININGU.—(1) 340-00 QIB:qflelo
340 of) QIdlofleno al000dUDlaflgiIss  UIleH®:Ud B¥lOGWI88 DM BPERLPVOTIND
SISOl WIHDIO) alleio—

() @@ 2RAO®OIMV  HHOOMAID  AMVoNDIBHOBHNOla] BPWIOS
GO6UIMEI0 @Ol )}0d:061E &0} BMISIMY MTBHIHOD}0; BSIOHD

(ii) @PO  2lAOMOMSS &H006MOMIOHNMSO, emoglal@d
QUBSMNLSDIFI88 MPEOD  VAROBIMSSIEB, @EIUBEE  alOWIUIMSSOY
2 10@QI0M 630} @RAITNVO0 MNTDHIND D)o

OIVE@ S0l 2RAOMIMB aldSIEOOM@®I6EN).

(2) (1)-00 Dalaidla] @13000 adle MluRIVENMM TV IBE@, HAVE@SOI
@I  9Udeq]SIdlesym noellmiomlend alelajo @oegEsl@ @sal, afls, 6an03@3,
QISUAVO®o, AF NN IMEBRUY a)MIIIHS MO0, QIR o, MUAIMo, h}SIHD TVBHHNI
OMICRIBHID]  HEMBIBEMEMI 2 306)a|SIAIBNMEMI GO oBO@EIelo 21S683UD
@685l MIBPRMIBEZUOEBRUD HEMBBIHLISIEGHEENI®IEM).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




16

(3) Y @EPELPVOVID HIFTD 2ACDIM  oGO®ODV} alloio 538 enil
QAU 10008 fIIB8  (@1BI00  BaO@MIBIO]  BiSIPl@®ODN  Galdeel
EDDSIBHENZMIGM.”.

21..509-00 QId}o 88 6BEROMI.—(@1WIM @B:Fleel 509-00 Qld: o l@d,—

(1) (1)-00 9aliB)a{l@d “390” ag) BRHHOMIN Ml “326m, 327, 335, 337,
340,” o) @RHNEBBSBo @RGHOQU 2llaMNEBBSlo GalBEHENZMIENT;

(ii) (6)-00 9alQiB)a{l@d “390” ag)m @RLEOOMINY Ml “326aVl, 327, 335, 337,
340,” ag)M @RENEBRSBI0 BRGHHON0 2illaM6EBRS0 CalBELSENBMOI6N);

(iii) (7)-00 9alQUd}afl@ “390” ag)am @RHOOMINY MBat “326ml, 327, 335, 337,
340,” ag)0M @RENEBRBo @RGHHONU 2llaMEBBRBo GalBBHENZMI6N).

22..565-00 Qld}o lN88 6EGEROML.—(IWIM @B:Fleel 565-00 Q@ |l@d,—

(i) (2)-00 @um&g@(oﬁ (@) SIEMLOBIMNIEUDHO MIOLJODIAM EUGIMUEBBUD
GalBCHENZMIA), BRI D) :—

“(a) @oELPo XVIag)- DI  ABGDRILSIVIBS  MoLIMITNVoMIH06M
Q@O NINWER]S Qllat@earRYD;

(weryy) 1986-0e1 aidlmudldl (Mood:Hem) @E:glme (1986-6e1 29-00
BH(B BYB:]) BPMIM Bl 2eMRIEIVISBS 21568303060 Al Mldamosm-
0a108l0e@ moellmienud, -a0ellmyeanud, wolallml MoellmEErUd, @VAld:SE:OMO
13Balled  moellmieanud, oJoqley moeilmeenud, BaMILIMIEBRU  agymlaimows]
NITWE ]S QlleH@EBRUD.”;

(ii) (4)-00 9alQIB)o @ “GREMMO ©aIE@IVO” )N QAUIBEGUBHE) ald:0o
" I®IMODI00 BJalEIB0" o) QAUIBNGUD CalBCHOENBDIGN).

23. 570-00 QId}o N8BS GRERVDI.—(I1WIM BYB:FIeE! 570-00 Qb @3, —

() (ag) QUMLODI@ “BOEOMYO} BIICWIVO” AN QAUIBNGHUBHE) ald®o
“al®IMOI0o  0JaIEIV” o)  QDENGSBlo  “GPMNIM; 0 ICIBO” o)
QDENHUBHE) aldh0o “DOIMID O IEIVO” af)IM QUIBNGSBlo CalBBHNENZ®I6NY;

(i) (end) @UEMLOMI@ “GPMIM} OJICWIVO” of)IM QAUISNGUBESE) ald®o
"SDOIMNIO Yo lEIVO" ag)(M QAUIHNGHUD BalBBHENZ®IEM).

24. 572-00 Qi) flmss 6GELWMI.—@IWOM @O&:Gleel 572-00 Qldla]  (1)-00
9alQldh)ol@d, “TUBE9IB” o)  QAUISBSIT)  @UDaHo, “BROERIBIT  TVBLHIA
@PW]B:006)q |S)ODI® DERPNAVNMR” o) QAUIBN}BUD G2IGBBOENB®IE.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




17

25. MOEIDo o ISIHOEN88  BRENML—(EIWIM BRBJIOL!I MILIdo  alglaail@d
"MUOWODEM UBlHBHUB" o) UBlBaHBHODIBBIFI@ (1)-00 EHISOMI@D,—

(i) 253-00 I {lom@e0 (3)-00 GBSO, “@mMolesle:81asW0 nQlo
ellqy  avadojlesym@lay  afldal  AEEMIM@IM” o) QAUOBEGBUBHBE)  ald@o
“NUNJaIMEERUD  MMELID@AIOS GalOIM@BH}MMI@ 0fl$al alOE®IM@IN” ag)om
QOB BalBBHSENBMIG);

(i) 335-00 QIS {lOMD®IO0,—

(ag) (3)00 GHISOMI@ “MINUDAUERSl0 2GS MOLlmEERS0
@M2l®20®  JTIVI@B  90HOQIFIBNMD”  o)D  QADSNGUBHS  ald0o
“@SHBOS@Io AUI6MIZAMNa IMEERBIOSDIo allVOe AU MVGHIBHIMISS
DOMOAUIEIDI0” ag)aMN QUIBNGUD C2lBCHHENBDIGNY;

(endl) (4)-00 EHHISOMI@ “@OEOMNA OJal” ag)M QAUILNDUDHBE) aldh®o
“al®MOI0o @Jal” ag)aM QAUILNHUD  BalBBHENBMIGNT;

(iii) 337-00 QIBYajlo, @PTlOMTIOO88 (3), (4) gy 6BI8@RSloE!
90006 0lo id8l0 BY1NI06HHMZMI6M);

(iv) 339-00 QIS {lON@NOO (4)-00 BHISOMI@ “OOIMG] BRAMUG Oat” ag)(M
QIBNGHUDHS) aldh0o “@PRID00 BYal” ag)(M AUIBNLG:UD BalBCHOEMBZMI6N);

(v) 340-00 QIdoflom@en (4)-00 6HISOMI@ “06N30@00 Oal” ag)aM
QONBHUBHE) aldh®o "al®IMNIDIDo Bal" o)A QUIBNGUD CalGCHHENMBMIGN);

(vi) 492-00 Qlds)a lOM@IO® (2)-00 EBISOMI@ “2” )M BPEOODIM ald:00
“12” ag)M @B GalQBHHENIMIG).

26. 03000ER0 &%l0eee.—(1) 2023-081 6508 mMIMleoeilgl (6eEU®I)
&08ulmadaV ( 2023-ee1 3) @M@ 03dssIDdleaimm;.

(2) @r&EBeM 030680MIGOMOHM D} (INVE}® BIBUIMABAY (@ 18000
BRRNM 921QY6e|3 EIWIM BYBIIMBIFIMD 21D «GOMEBSIEN0 HIVIGRO af)SIOTD)
aBOOBIERe  MSalSlE@I, MM @YGQ (@IS0 GRENGI  62lQea]s  (IWIM
@GBS 6.21DD@ICWI 2g)SIOMDICI B0}MEN|BSENBEE.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




18

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA
Law (Legislation-C) Department
NOTIFICATION

No. 64/Leg.C1/2023/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 2nd March, 2024
18th Kumbham, 1199
12th Phalguna, 1945.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in

English language of the Kerala Municipality (Amendment) Act, 2024 (6 of 2024).

By order of the Governor,

C. VIJAYA LAKSHMI,
Special Secretary (Law).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




19

[Translation in English of “2024-6)£1 6808 mymlavlaoellgl (6e30@I) @&sq” published under
the authority of the Governor.]

ACT 6 OF 2024
THE KERALA MUNICIPALITY (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2024

An

Act

further to amend the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994

Preamble.—WHEREAS, it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Municipality Act,1994
of for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

BE it enacted in the Seventy-fifth year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala Municipality
( Amendment) Act, 2024.

(2) Items (i) and (vi) of section 25 shall come into force at once and the remaining

sections shall be deemed to have come into force on the 9" day of December, 2023.

2. Amendment of section 58.—In the Kerala Municipality Act,1994 (20 of 1994)
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in sub-section (1) of section 58 of the principal
Act, after the words and symbol “welfare programmes,” the words and symbol “waste
management,” shall be inserted.

3. Insertion of Chapter XVIA.—After section 325 of the principal Act and above the
heading “Management of waste ” ,“CHAPTER XVIA” shall be inserted.

4. Insertion of new section 325A.—In the principal Act, after the heading
“CHAPTER XVIA, Management of waste”, the following section shall be inserted,

namely:—

“325A. Definition—For the purpose of this chapter and section 58, “waste
management” means the segregation, collection, transportation, storage, processing or disposal
of waste, including solid waste.

Explanation.—Words and expressions used in this chapter and not defined, but
defined in the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986), and the rules made
thereunder, shall have the same meanings respectively assigned to them in the said Act and the
rules.”.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




20

5. Amendment of section 326.—In section 326 of the principal Act,—
(1) for sub-section (1a), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1a) All the duties, responsibilities and functions of the municipality pertaining
to waste management as provided in this chapter and the rules made under this Act, and in the
Environment (Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986), and the rules made thereunder,
shall vest with the council, and the council shall discharge its duties, responsibilities and
functions through the Secretary.”;

(i1) after sub-section (1a), so substituted, the following sub-section, shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(1aa) It shall be the responsibility of the Secretary to discharge the duties,
responsibilities and functions of the Municipality under sub-section (1a), and the Secretary may
by order in writing entrust the said duties to officers and employees having the charge of waste
management, public health, sanitation and engineering or any other officers or employees of
the Municipality, on the basis of streets or areas or the nature of work, and ensure that such
duties, responsibilities and functions are duly discharged by them.”.

(ii1) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) The Municipality may directly or through any person or agency or on contract basis
or otherwise, make arrangements in whole or in part, for carrying out waste management
activities under this Act and the rules made thereunder or the Environment (Protection) Act,
1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986) and the rules made thereunder.”.

6. Insertion of new sections after section 326.—After section 326 of the principal Act,
the following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“326 A. Council to carry out Government directions.—(1) It shall be the
responsibility of the Council to carry out directions issued by the Government in pursuance of
the solid waste management under this Act or the Environment (Protection) Act, 1986
(Central Act 29 of 1986) or the rules made thereunder.

(2) The Chairperson shall ensure that the agenda prepared in connection with
the directions issued under sub-section (1) is placed before the Council in its next meeting and
the Council shall take decision on such agenda .

(3) In cases where the Council fails to take decision in accordance with the
directions issued under sub-section (1) within one month of the receipt of the same, it shall be
deemed that permission for carrying out such directions has been approved or given by the
Council.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




21

(4) The Secretary shall immediately take steps to implement such decisions,
including the deemed approval under sub-section (3), and if there is any failure or default by
the Secretary or any other responsible officer in implementing such decision, the Government
may initiate disciplinary action against the Secretary or such officer, considering it as
dereliction of duty.

(5) If the Council fails to comply with the directions of the Government under
sub-section (1), the Government may, impose fine on the Council, without prejudice to any
other actions that may be initiated against the Council:

Provided that a reasonable opportunity of being heard shall be given to the Council
before imposing the said fine.

326B. Responsibilities of Secretary on waste management.—(1) The Secretary may
initiate legal actions against any person who contravenes the provisions of this chapter and may
compound offences which are compoundable under this Act or the rules made thereunder.

(2) The Secretary shall have all the powers for effectively carrying out the
responsibilities regarding the waste management under this chapter or any other law for the
time being in force.

(3) The Secretary may, in exigencies after informing the chairperson, expend an
amount not exceeding two lakh rupees out of the municipal fund concerned, for discharging
the functions vested with him under this chapter or any other law for the time being in force
relating to waste management.

326C. Responsibility to handover segregated waste to the Municipality or authorised
agency.—(1) It shall be the responsibility of every household, owners, occupiers of any
premises, hotel, restaurant, industry, hospital or any other establishment to hand over or deposit
segregated waste in the designated location and pay the user fee to the municipality or
authorised agency as directed by the Secretary through public notice.

(2) The Secretary may impose a fine which shall not be less than one thousand
rupees but not exceeding ten thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions
under sub-section (1).

326D. Provisions relating to user fee—(1) Each Municipality shall fix a user fee, to
meet the whole or part of the cost for providing services in connection with segregation,
collection, transportation, storage, processing and disposal of waste on every waste generator
and collect the same in the manner as may be specified by the municipality:

Provided that if the Government have fixed the rate for user fee, the Council shall
not fix a rate less than the rate fixed by the Government.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




22

(2) Each waste generator shall pay the user fee to the Municipality or to any
authorised agency before the last date of every month or within such period as may be decided
by the Municipality.

(3) If any waste generator fails to pay the user fee as provided under sub-section
(2), it shall be recovered, together with fine at the rate of fifty percent per month:

Provided that such fine shall be recovered only where such user fee has not been
remitted even after the expiry of ninety days from the specified date.

(4) The user fee together with the fine shall be recovered as arrears of public

revenue as specified in section 538 B.

(5) The Secretary, without prejudice to any other action that may be taken
against the defaulter of the user fee, may refuse to provide any service from the Municipality
to such defaulter until the user fee is paid.

(6) The Government or in accordance with the guidelines as may be issued by
the Government from time to time, the Municipality may, exempt any waste generator or class
of waste generators or owners or occupiers of any unoccupied or vacant buildings, from the

payment of user fee in whole or in part .”.

7. Substitution of new section for section 327 —For section 327 of the principal Act, the
following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“327. Duties of waste generators for storage and deposit of solid waste—(1) It shall
be the duty of each waste generator to provide separate bins or receptacles of the size and colour,
as may be prescribed in the rules or bye laws or as may be specified by the Secretary, for the
purpose of storage of biodegradable, non-biodegradable and domestic hazardous waste.

(2) Such bins or receptacles shall always be kept in good condition and shall be
provided in such numbers and at such places as the Secretary may, from time to time, direct by
public notice.

(3) Each waste generator shall segregate and deposit the waste, as specified in
the rules or bye laws, for easy collection and disposal of such waste by the employees or
contractors engaged by the Municipality.

(4) The Secretary may impose a fine which shall not be less than one thousand
rupees but not exceeding ten thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions
under sub-section (3).”.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




23

8. Amendment of section 328.—In section 328 of the principal Act,—

(1) for the marginal heading the following marginal heading shall be substituted,
namely:—

“Contract with waste generator or owner or occupier for the removal of waste”;

(i1) in the existing provision, for the words “the owner or occupier of any premises
to remove rubbish or filth”, the words “the waste generator or owner or occupier of any
premises for the removal of waste” shall be substituted.

9. Substitution of new section for section 329.—For section 329 of the principal Act, the

following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“329. Door to door collection of waste.—(1) Each Municipality, in the municipal
area, shall arrange door to door collection of segregated waste from all households, settlements,
commercial institutions and other non-residential premises and in the case of multi-storied
buildings, commercial complexes, malls, housing complexes etc. from the entry gate or any
other location as may be specified by the Secretary through public notice.

(2) Segregated waste collected as per sub-section (1) shall not be transported or

brought for treatment or disposal unless it is properly covered .”.
10. Amendment of section 331.—In section 331 of the principal Act,—
(1) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) A Municipality that does not have a solid, liquid, sewage or faecal sludge
treatment plant but possess vacant land within or outside the municipal area shall undertake
projects for the setting up of such plants or facilities on the said land on top priority.”;

(i1) after sub-section (1), so substituted, the following sub-sections shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(1a) Each Municipality shall identify suitable private land within or outside the
municipal area for the purpose of waste management, if necessary, acquire the land under the
Right to Fair Compensation and Transparency in Land Acquisition, Rehabilitation and
Resettlement Act, 2013 (Central Act 30 of 2013) or by land relinquishment or on lease or
through private purchase.

(1b) The land acquired by the Municipality under the sub-section (1a) shall not be
used for any other purpose without the prior sanction of the Government.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




24

(1c) Each Municipality shall give priority to utilise its own vacant land or land
vested in it for waste management activities where the land is available for the same.

(1d) The Municipality shall take all possible steps to resume waste management
activities on the land, which was previously utilized for such activities but remains unused
due to various reasons:

Provided that such land shall not be diverted or utilised for any other purposes or
activities without prior sanction of the Government.”;

(ii1) in sub-section (2), for the words, symbol, bracket and figure “notifying the land
under sub-section (1)”, the words, symbol, bracket, figure and letter “identifying the land
under sub-section (1a) shall be substituted.

11. Insertion of new sections after section 332.—After section 332 of the principal Act,
the following sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“332A. Setting up of joint waste management projects.—The Municipality may, if
the Council so decides or if so required by the Government, set up joint waste management
projects with any other Local Self Government Institution on such terms and conditions, as
may be agreed by such Local Self Government Institutions, subject to the guidelines as may
be issued by the Government in this regard.

332B. Municipality to make arrangement for conducting regular inspection and
monitoring.—It shall be the responsibility of the municipality to make arrangements for
conducting regular inspections and monitoring of the waste management activities and
projects in the municipality to ensure that it is being operated or implemented in compliance
with the required standards and in accordance with the relevant laws.

332C. Responsibilities of individuals and rewards for reporting offences.—(1) Any
person may report before the Secretary regarding any violation of the provisions in this
chapter or any offence relating to waste management, including littering, dumping or throwing
waste into public places and water bodies.

(2) Subject to the guidelines as may be issued by the Government, from time
to time, the Municipality may give rewards to persons who report violations and offences
under sub-section (1).

(3) Any person who maliciously or intentionally makes a false report under
sub-section (1) to harm or cause loss to another person shall, on conviction, be punished with
fine which may extend to ten thousand rupees.

332D. Beneficial provisions for residents near to waste treatment Centres.—(1) The
Municipality may, subject to the rules or guidelines as may be made or issued by the
Government, provide incentives, including but not limited to tax exemptions or relaxations or

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




25

welfare schemes to the residing in the immediate vicinity of centralised waste treatment
centres or disposal sites.

(2) The Municipality may establish convenient and beneficial facilities such as
parks, playgrounds, recycling facilities, swap shops and physical training facilities, for the
well-being and recreational opportunities of the residents in the vicinity of centralised waste
treatment centres or disposal sites.”.

12. Amendment of section 333.—In section 333 of the principal Act, the existing
provision shall be numbered as sub-section (1) thereof, and after sub-section (1) so numbered,
the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2) No person shall organise an event or gathering of more than one hundred
persons at any unlicensed place without intimating the Municipality, at least three working
days in advance and such person or the organiser of such event shall ensure segregation of
waste at source and handing over of the same to the waste collector or agency as specified by
the Municipality on such fees as may be fixed by the Municipality:

Provided that such fees shall not be less than the actual rate of cost for the management
of such waste and the same shall be paid in advance as directed by Municipality.”.

13. Substitution of new section for section 334 C.—For section 334 C of the principal
Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“334C. Constitution of Waste Management Fund.—(1) Each Municipality shall
constitute a fund, by name, “Waste Management Fund”, and it shall be managed in
accordance with the rules made or guidelines issued by the Government .

(2) The following shall be credited to the Waste Management Fund, namely:—

(a) amounts recovered as fine or penalty in connection with violations of
waste management;

(b) contributions received from Corporate Social Responsibility (CSR)
funds for the purpose of waste management;

(c) sponsorship amounts or any other contributions received for this purpose;
(d) any other amount as specified by the Government.
(3) The Fund shall be utilised for the following purposes,—

(a) all waste management activities, including but not limited to segregation,
collection, transportation, management, processing, disposal of waste etc;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




26

(b) purchase and installation of equipments necessary for effective waste
management;

(c) training and capacity development programmes to enhance the skills and
knowledge of employees engaged in waste management;

(d) any other activities related to waste management as approved by the
Government.”.

14. Substitution of new section for section 335.—For section 335 of the principal Act,
the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“335. Responsibility to keep the premises of shops and commercial establishments
clean.—(1) It shall be the responsibility of the owner or occupier of each shop and
commercial establishment to keep its premises clean and not to throw, litter, deposit or burn
any waste on its premises or allow customers to throw, litter, deposit or burn any waste on its
premises.

(2) The Secretary or an officer specially authorised by the Secretary may, on
being satisfied that any person has violated the provisions in sub-section (1), impose on such
person a fine which may extend to five thousand rupees on the basis of extent, gravity and
nature of the said violation.

(3) The fine imposed under sub-section (2) shall be remitted within fifteen days
from the date of its imposition and in default of such payment, the Secretary shall initiate
prosecution proceedings without prejudice to any other actions that may be taken against him.

Explanation.—For the purpose of this section, the words ‘shops’, ‘commercial
establishment’ shall have the same meanings respectively assigned to them in the Kerala
Shops and Commercial Establishments Act,1960 ( 34 of 1960).”.

15. Substitution of new section for section 337 —For section 337 of the principal Act,
the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“337. Prohibition of draining of used water into public places or water bodies—(1) No
person shall drain or allow to drain waste water from any sink, drain, stable, hotel, restaurant,
household, industry, hospital or other establishment into any public drain, road, street or
public place or water body or water course or allow or cause to drain such used water out of
such premises.

(2) The Secretary may impose a fine which shall not be less than five thousand
rupees but not exceeding fifty thousand rupees on any person who contravenes the provisions
under sub-section (1).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




27

(3) The Secretary may, by notice, direct the owner or occupier of such premises
to close or shut or remove any pipe or tube or other means by which used water is allowed to
flow into any public road, drain or street or any other public place or water bodies.

(4) Any person who has been given a direction under sub-section (3) shall
comply with such directions within a period of seven days of its receipt and if he fails to
comply with such directions, the Secretary shall, without prejudice to the actions that may be
taken under sub-section (2), close, shut or remove such pipe, tube or other means and shall
recover the actual expenditure incurred for such removal from him.”.

16. Substitution of new section for section 340.—For section 340 of the principal Act,
the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340. Prohibition of throwing waste into public places or private places.—(1) No
person shall throw, litter, deposit, burn or bury any waste on any street, drain or public place
that is not intended for such use, or caused such acts to be done.

(2) No person shall throw, litter, deposit, burn or bury any waste in any private
places or caused to do such act, otherwise as prescribed or in accordance with the directions
issued by the Secretary.

(3) The Secretary or an officer specially authorised by the Secretary for the
purpose may, on being satisfied that any person who has violated the provisions in
sub-sections (1) or (2), impose on such person on the spot, a fine which may extend to five
thousand rupees on the basis of extent, gravity and nature of the said violation.

(4) The fine imposed under sub-section (3) shall be remitted within fifteen days
from the date of its imposition and in default of such payment, the Secretary shall initiate
prosecution proceedings, without prejudice to any other action which may be taken against
him.”.

17. Substitution of new section for section 3404.—For section 340 A of the principal
Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340A. Prohibition of depositing waste or rubbish or excreta in water bodies and
water sources.—(1) No person shall throw or deposit waste or rubbish or excreta in a water
course, water body or water source or allow or cause to flow water from any latrine or allow
waste water to flow into it or pollute the water in any other way or engage or depute or
compel or instigate any person to do such activity.

(2) An offence under sub-section (1) shall be cognizable and non-bailable.

(3) Whoever commits an offence referred to in sub-section (1), shall, on
conviction, be punishable with fine which shall not be less than ten thousand rupees but not

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




28

exceeding fifty thousand rupees and with imprisonment for a term which shall not be less than
six months but not exceeding one year.”.

18. Substitution of new section for section 340 B.—For section 340 B of the principal
Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“340B. Seizure and confiscation of the vehicle used for carrying waste or
excreta—(1) The Secretary or an officer of the Municipality authorised by the Secretary in
this behalf or a Police Officer not below the rank of Sub-Inspector shall seize a vehicle or
vessel carrying waste or excreta through public place or public road with the intention or
preparation to commit an offence under this chapter or having reasonable cause to suspect that
the vehicle or vessel is on its return after being used for such deposit, and shall produce
before the Sub Divisional Magistrate having jurisdiction.

(2) After conducting inquiry, if the Sub Divisional Magistrate is satisfied that
there is reasonable ground to believe that the vehicle or vessel has been used for committing
any offences under this chapter, the vehicle or vessel so seized may be confiscated, and in any
other case, it shall be released.

(3) No order confiscating any vehicle or vessel shall be made under this section
unless the owner of such vehicle or vessel or the person from whom it is seized,—

(i) 1is given a notice in writing informing him, the grounds on which the
vehicle or vessel is to be confiscated; and

(11) is given an opportunity of being heard against the ground of confiscation
within such reasonable time as may be specified in the notice.

(4) In cases where the vehicle or vessel seized contains waste, rubbish or
excreta, the person seizing the vehicle or vessel, if he is not the Secretary, shall immediately
inform the Secretary of such seizure, and the Secretary shall, without prejudice to any actions
that may be taken under this chapter, take step to dispose of such waste, rubbish or excreta at
the expense of the owner of the vehicle or vessel, and the Secretary shall recover the cost of
such disposal together with a fine not exceeding five thousand rupees from the owner.

(5) Where the vehicle or vessel is confiscated, it shall be auctioned and the
amount so received shall be credited to the Waste Management Fund.”.

19. Amendment of section 345.—In section 345 of the principal Act, for the words,
figure and letter “and which does not fall under the purview of section 340A”, the words “for
which no punishment is provided elsewhere in this chapter” shall be substituted.

20. Insertion of new section 3454.—After section 345 of the principal Act, the following
section shall be inserted, namely:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




29

“345A. Provisions regarding imposition of fine—(1) No fine under this chapter,
except penalty specified in sections 340 and 340A shall be imposed by the Secretary unless
the person concerned,—

(1) is given a notice in writing informing him of the grounds on which the fine
is to be imposed; and

(i1) is given an opportunity of being heard within such reasonable time as may
be specified in the notice.

(2) While fixing the fine under sub-section (1), the Secretary shall consider the size
or quantity of the waste involved, the category, size and location of the household, hotel,
industry or other establishment and any rules or guidelines as may be made or issued by the
Government in this behalf.

(3) Any fine imposed under this chapter shall be recovered as arrears of public
revenue as specified in section 538 B.”.

21. Amendment of section 509.—In section 509 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (1), before the figure “390’the figures , letter and symbols “326C,
327, 335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted;

(i1) in sub-section (6), before the figure “390the figures, letter and symbols*“326C,
327,335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted,;

(ii1) in sub-section (7), before the figure “390” the figures, letter and symbols
“326C, 327, 335, 337, 340,” shall be inserted.

22. Amendment of section 565.—In section 565 of the principal Act,—

(1) in sub-section (2), after clause (u), the following clauses shall be inserted,
namely:—

“(v) matters relating to waste management as specified in chapter XVI A;

(w) matters relating to construction-demolition waste, e -waste, sanitary waste,
domestic hazardous waste, plastic waste and liquid waste subject to the Environment
(Protection) Act, 1986 (Central Act 29 of 1986) and the rules made thereunder.”;

(i1) in sub-section (4), for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “ten thousand
rupees’ shall be substituted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/




30

23. Amendment of section 570.—In section 570 of the principal Act,—(i) in clause (a),
for the words “five hundred rupees” the words “ten thousand rupees” and for the words “fifty
rupees” the words “two hundred rupees” shall be substituted;

(i1) in clause (b), for the words “fifty rupees” the words “two hundred rupees” shall
be substituted.

24. Amendment of section 572.—In sub-section (1) of section 572 of the principal Act,
after the word “Government”, the words “or an officer authorised by the Government” shall
be inserted.

25. Amendment of Fourth Schedule—In the Fourth Schedule of the principal Act, under
the heading “Penalties” in column (1),—

(1) against section 253, in column (3), for the words “Failure to furnish list of
employees etc” the words and symbol* Failure to furnish name of institutions etc.” shall be
substituted;

(i1) against section 335,—

(a) in column (3), for the words “Improper disposal of carcasses rubbish and
filth” the words “Responsibility to keep the premises of shops and commercial establishments
clean” shall be substituted;

(b) in column (4), for the words “Rupees five hundred” the words “Rupees ten
thousand” shall be substituted;

(111) section 337 and the entries against it in columns (3) and (4) shall be omitted;

(iv) against section 339, in column (4), for the words “Rupees two hundred and
fifty” the words “Rupees five thousand” shall be substituted;

(v) against section 340, in column (4), for the words “Rupees two thousand”
the words “Rupees ten thousand” shall be substituted;

(vi) against section 492, in column (2), for the figure “2” the figure “12” shall
be substituted.

26. Repeal and saving.—(1) The Kerala Municipality (Amendment) Ordinance, 2023
(3 0£2023) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the
principal Act as amended by the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken
under the principal Act as amended by this Act.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES

AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2024/ yr=. Digitally signed by Veeran T

Date:2024.03.04 09:58:47 +05:30

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https.//compose.kerala.gov.in/



		2024-03-04T21:58:47+0530
	Veeran T




